AN

gofiga wa—ovo / DowT0-30 / 03

B HET—27 (@)
(@mEE= ¢ ave RTee M=)

A1, TGOS (P)
(Serraer srfdrfors)

QENXIGH, HATY, 09 BRA, 2005 L0

HTEl 20, 1926 V% Wraq

faem vd Gud &1 faur

W 431 /faurd v wedy &1 /2005
QEUGA, 09 B, 2005

SIferRaT
fafe

CHRG BT HAEH @ 9w8T 200 @ ef SquTd ARl | ERNECREIG
mmﬁﬁm(ﬁmmﬂw,nﬁﬁamafﬁwﬁﬁaﬂmﬁaﬁﬁw)
(Hener) fasaa, 2005 W fRATF 01—02-2005 w1 START ye B S 9% IaRiae sffrw
ﬂia:n13,‘&?[2005$m#mwaﬁ?@mﬁwaﬁmﬁmmnmﬁﬁmw?|

SR (faem v wew, 5@y qor aftreia) 9 Syafery s
UeE) (Fenes) arfifre, 2005
(@rferfas W@ 13, 99 2005)

(Ser STRiae f3gm= 9w erT ailg g3l
SR WY S U wvsd (Wewnl @ syt Y Uwrer) siferfam, 1980, v

TToT TT TP =T . i s =\ A Py e T ¥ P 3 G . S—
TRy W frarr wvem (afemERay @ e s W) WIOIT, 1952, N RRY Ao S

AT AR gl Suaeg) aferfrgw, 1081 (T STRITS W A1) TAT SR U2 IR G How s




| i ——

2 SUNad MR Tole, 09 BYa¥), 2005 30 (W€l 20, 1926 ¥dH THQ)

(wewat @Y Syafeat AR d99) (ﬁﬂ"ﬂﬂﬁf?ﬁﬂﬂ)aﬁtﬁﬂ. 2001 &1 STRIE & gRAe d
IR GMET o @ fod : :

ferfras

HRE TRISY @ g=eed af A frafateg aftfas eqmar o 8 — -

it |
3Ny

ERT 4 &I

€N 5 &l

ETRT 14 &1

EIRT 15 &1

T 15— & &1
RiRNIBE

gRT 18—® &
e

EIRT 24 1
reneA

1.

AATIT—TDH
RS
(1) ¥e afafrm Swriga (R gar e, 460 aun afteRar a1
Suafert R Yer) (deies) aftifm, 2005 FT SR
(2) ¥g ueell adel, 2004 B WG BIITI

FGTY—<l

SOR WY AP W& 23, 9 1980 B URT 3 B WG

L

8.

9.

TR w2y sy faue wvsd (Wewdl @ suatedi R g s,
1980 F), Fr® U a=Ag ¥ A e ffrm FEr T @, awr 3 A
SERT (1) ¥ ¥ °) R BUA B WM W UK W sOR 39 X
fd e
qd il & grT 4 § Uk U9 TR U’ @ WM W AR 9
FOR 09 6 v’ @ Rl s -
e afafEs 9 arT 5 9 SugRT (2) q-
g U BOIR BUA’ B WM W ¥ 9 TR vwd’ v
CICEN :
q@ afifr A arT 14 @ @ve (3) @ i wge ¥ w= Q9 a9l
Wear @ I W) s uie | afte aew v Rl o |
1o fafras &) arT 15 A-
(E)Hum?rh)ﬁmﬁ'ﬂ\wﬁuwm'a%wmwmm?ﬁﬁqﬁm'
@ R W :
(@) SugRT (2) A weg &) W U’ @ W W R G Gl gEny eud
(M) SuaRT (3) ¥ weg G W v’ @ Wi W W Al gy vud’
g fad s
Tl APy ) arr 15-% ¥ U Uh BN TR $ I R s T
gIR diw d vud’ xw el s
Wt AR &) 9T 18- @ @ve (@) ¥ R TS BN U B ¥
w® R Q) gR U v@ fad wEd
qa sfrfras &1 garr 24 9
(%) STaRT (1) % T 'YH R Ui G $UA° B IATT W G Gl AR
(@) Wgs ¥ wee T W YN’ @ W R T & Wl um eud W
fed wma;




STRIAS AWTEIRYT TWIe, 09 HRAX], 2005 30 (A€ 20, 1926 IH WH)

() oM wge @ uvEn frefafEa wge e R s,
FAfq:—

: "I, ¥E AR o faEm war /U wR 91 Rafv A e g @ s
e @ fafy ¥ ) R wer @ vo SudvE 9% @) safy @ o
T8 Hew @ UTH saledl @ foad @ 9 @) | Qe wen e ssae
I8l B AR I90 @Ay & IRW 3w WU ¥ I ug W I ' s
(ﬂ)quwqmﬁmmmaw@mwﬁmmm

Ffa— :
'W%W—aﬁf%‘eﬁmﬁﬂﬁwa}ma%m#m e a1
Iud IS fog o af @ oA Al @ fod arf fear 8, a8t == anr
% yarerEref I8 usn S e sw @fea 3 e o @ Rl vew @
w1 A orf fooar 21
JeATF—fIT
9TR YR¥ Iy faue aved (freRat @ daq qwnr wd)
ferfram, 1952 (F2n STiEd A ¥gd) &1 wAEH
10. ST W2 oY Ru qved (fraTRAY @ daw aur Ax) A, 1952
@, fort 3t s e ¥ e A @E T 2, g 2 @) suuRn (1)

ﬁmﬂmmiﬂm D AT X ¥g wmm g o

SRS
11. qaa‘faﬁmaﬁqm4aﬁwm(3)ﬁw ﬁmuﬁnﬁm @
WM W WK Ui gaR v9d’ v fed W
IEYTI—AN
SR yo ¥ #Al (@dq, #ar AR ydivl Suese) afifram, 1981
(e SNrEd W Oyqs) &1 e
12. OTR #ew A1 (@09, =<7 o wof Susew) aftrfrgy, 1981 fored smt
qo afefraq @1 @ 2, @ gt 34—
(@) ST (1) ¥ g g1 FUIR Ui 6 9 B I W e UTT gR
(@) SUERT (2) ¥ s T VR Gl 6 U=¥ v @ XU R Y UR
TR U’ v ) W
13. o A &) gr1 6 & SyuRT (1) ¥ e 99 ©) ok W fafvw
D WA D WA W UK TS 500 YR ot @ " F A 15000 @
aftre w1d &l @ A S
JLATI—Y1d
STIY WY Y faum wved (el @) Sydferi sk 9vE)
(STRT= Wees) aftfras, 2001 O amd qa aftrfarm
Pl 14T 8, & ORI 3 ¥ Wee+
14. o sfafag @) g 3 F-

HIRT 2 B
wenes

HIRT 4 BT
wenes

gIRT 3 &1
HeTEs

1T 6 BT

"I WIS FOR ¥9A @ VA HUA B INEN BT gAY ol Aqg




4 STRIFE SHERY TWE, 09 GRaAX), 2005 $0 (WIE 20, 1926 U WHT)

8 @1 AV IR A FOR 9 B e BUT B W W e
ToUTTd TR v9 & Yo U B TR A el vt @ ¥ qe
ﬁqmﬁrﬁﬁamv@ﬁ%ﬁgw‘mﬁﬁmﬂr’

ATST |,

argo o Wﬁn
e wfa |

No. 431/Vidhayee & Sansadiya Karya/2005
Dated Dehradun, February 09, 2005

NOTIFICATION
Miscellaneous

IN pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttaranchal
(Emoluments and Pension of the State Assembly Members, Ministers and Officers) (Amendment)
Bill, 2005 (Uttaranchal Adhiniyam Sankhya 13 of2005). :

As passed by the Uttaranchal Legislative Assembly and assented to by the Governor on
February 01, 2005.

THE UTTARANCHAL (EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION OF THE STATE ASSEMBLY
MEMBERS, MINISTERS AND OFFICERS) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2005
(Act No. 13 oF 2005) .

(As passed by the Uttaranchal State Assembly)

Further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislatur~ (Members Emoluments and Pension)
Act, 1980, the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1952, the
Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provision) Act, 1981 (as applicable
in the Uttaranchal) and The Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Member's Emoluments and Pension
(Uttaranchal Amendment) Act, 2001.

AN
AcT

Itis HEREBY enacted in the Fifty-Fifth Year of the Republic of India as follows :--

CHAPTER-I
PRELIMINARY

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called The Uttaranchal (Eméiurﬁents and Pension of the

Commencement State Assembly Members, Ministers and Officers) (Amendment) Act, 2005.
(2) itshall come into force with effect from April 01, 2004 e

CHAPTER-II
AMENDMENT IN SECTION 3 OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE
LEGISLATURE ACT NO. 23 OF 198¢
2. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members Emoluments and
Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to in this Chapler as the principal Act. in

sub-section (1) for the words ‘Two thousand rupees’ the words ‘Three thousand
rupees’ shall be substituted.




N | =

STURTTel JETENRTT IGIE, 09 HRasl, 2005 $0 (AT 20, 1926 ¥ &waq) 5
3. In section 4 of the principal Act for the words ‘Five thousand rupees’ the words Amendment  of
‘Seven thousand five hundred rupees’ shall be-substituted. Section 4
4. In sub-section (2) of section 5 of the principal Act-- ;S\mendment of
: s
: “For.the words ‘Ten thousand rupees’ the words ‘Twenty thousand rupees’ byl
shall be substituted.” ‘
9. In section 14 of the principal Act, in clause (d), in the second proviso for the Amendment of
words “Two members’ the words ‘Five members’ shall be substituted. Section 14
6. In section 15 of the principal Act-- 5 Amendment of
Section 15
(@) In sub-section (1) for the words “Two hundred fifty rupees’ the words ‘Three i
hundred rupees’ shall be substituted; ;
(b) Insub section (2) for the words ‘two hundred rupees’ the words ‘two ~:rdred
fifty rupees’ shall be substituted:;
() Insub-section (3) for the words “Two hundred rupees’ the words ‘Two hundred
fifty rupees’ shall be substituted. ‘
7. In section 15-A of the principal Act, for the words ‘One thousand rupees’ the Amendment of
words “Two thousand five hundred rupees’ shall be substituted. Section 15-A
8. In section 18-A of the principal Act, in clause (a) for the words ‘One thousand Amendinent ol
rupees’ the words “Two thousand rupees’ shall be substituted. Section 18-A
9. Insection 24 of the principal Act-- Amendment of
(@) Insub-section (1)for the words ‘One thousand five hundred rupees’ the words Seen
“Two thousand rupees’ shall be substituted:;
(b) Inthe proviso for the words ‘Two hundred rupees’ the words ‘Two hundred fifty
rupees’ shall be substituted;
(c) After the first proviso the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:--
“Provided further that in the event of dissolution of Assembly, the period from
the date of dissolution of Assembly, till the date of first meeting who has been the
speaker of the dissolved Assembly and has continued to be in office as such
during the said period.”
(d) Afterthe aforesaid proviso the following explanation shall be inserted, namely:--
"EXpIanation--Where a person has served as a member of the Assembly for
the term of six months and above and has not completed one year then such
person shall for the purpose of calculating the pension, be deemed to have served
as a member for the year.”
CHAPTER-III
AMENDMENT OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE
(OFFICERS SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) ACT, 1952
(As applicable in the Uttaranchal)
10. In section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and g‘m:f"df;ef“ of
Allowances)Act, 1952, hereinafter in this Chapter referred to as the principal Act, S¢°tion 2
in sub-section (1) for the words ‘Two thousand and five hundred rupees’ the words
‘Five thousand rupees’ shall be substituted.
11. In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3) for the words ‘Two thousand Q&EQSTE“' of

and five hundred rupees’ the words ‘Five thousand rupees’ shall be substituted.




6 SORITe TR TSiE, 09 BYAd, 2005 0 (AT 20, 1926 WH WH)

CHAPTER-IV
AMENDMENT OF THE UTTAR PRADESH MINISTERS (SALARIES,
ALLOWANCES AND MISCELLANEOUS PROVISION) ACT, 1981
(As applicable in the Uttaranchal)

Amendment of 12. In section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
Section 3 Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981 herein referred to as principal Act--

(@) Insub-section (1) for the words ‘Two thousand five hundred rupees’ the words
‘Five thousand rupees’ shall be substituted;

(b) In sub-section (2) for the words “Two thousand two hundred and twenty five
rupees’ the words ‘Four thousand rupees’ shall be substituted.

Amendment of 13. In section 6 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) for the words ‘at such rates

Section 6 and upon such conditions as may be prescribed’ the words ‘Five hundred rupees
per day, which shall not exceed Fifteen thousand rupees in a month’ shall be
substituted.

CHAPTER-V

AMENDMENT OF 3 OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE
(MEMBERS EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION) (UTTARANCHAL AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2001, HEREINAFTER REFERRED AS PRINCIPAL ACT

14. In the sub-section (1) of section 3 of the principal Act--

"For the words ‘Expenses of diesel equivalent to the amount of Railway Coupon
for Sixty thousand rupees and the balance Thirty three thousand as Railway
Coupon’ the words ‘Expenses of diesel equivalent to the amount of Railway Coupon
for Ninety six thousand rupees and the balance Twenty four thousand rupees a
Railway Coupon’ shall be substituted.” ;

By Order,

l.J.MALHOTRA,.
Principal Secretary.

fowHoo(aRogo) 13 fAurfl /68—2005—85+500 (HFeR /Aferan) |

-c\\n-,



